
is building positive

In her 10 years of experience, Alyssa Parsons has contributed to several high-
profile projects at BNIM. Her portfolio includes significant contributions to the 
Pacific Center Campus Development in San Diego; a Precinct Plan and new 
parking facility at Washington University; the production of several new high-
performance buildings at the Summit Bechtel Scout Reserve; the EPA Region 
7 Headquarters facility in Lenexa, Kansas; and the adaptive reuse of Westport 
Middle School into the largest co-working space in the world.

In her roles as project manager and project architect, Alyssa has proven
her ability to continually see the big picture while managing the necessary
details through each project phase. She is a passionate practitioner and is
deeply committed to her projects. Her clients describe her as an exhibitor of
thoughtful leadership, even in tough and demanding situations. Internally, her 
colleagues recognize her as collaborative, detail-oriented, and highly skilled.

Alyssa’s passion and commitment extend beyond the boundaries of
architecture. A 2020 graduate of the Kansas City Chamber’s Centurions
Leadership Program, she is a leader within her community. She is actively 
involved in several initiatives and organizations that all share a common goal: 
elevating the Kansas City community, particularly realizing the full potential 
of its urban core. Her thesis research looked into redevelopment opportunities 
in the West Bottoms and along the River — two areas that are experiencing a 
resurgence of interest in development. 

She is also active at the neighborhood level, representing residents of 
downtown advocating for developments that support the Greater Downtown 
Area Plan. Alyssa sits on the Downtown Neighborhood Association’s (DNA) 
Development Committee, serves of the Board of Directors for the Kansas City 
Design Center, and is a member of the Urban Land Institute (ULI). In 2016, she 
was appointed to the KCMO Brownfields Commission through which Alyssa 
has put her research, advocacy, and professional expertise into practice to 
make real, lasting change in her city.
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